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Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com> 8 October 2023 at 08:55

To: Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>

Roda

Should | ask you to forward this, or should | send it directly to Kalu?
Thanks

Adrian

Kalu

I will make the following purchases for the WDCO website using my own credit card, as all the suppliers operate on
the internet only.

Please confirm that you will reimburse me from the WDCO budget on receipt of the invoices.

Many thanks

Adrian

Of the £1200 allocated budget for the website | propose to spend the following:

Purpose Supplier ﬂyear cost 4 year cost Cost thereafter
Hosting Hostinger n/a £229.82 c£130
Web address Easily.uk ? Already registered ?
wdco.org.uk
Minutes Page WP Display by S29/£24 $116/£95 S29/£24
Flippercode
Members Contact WPForms $49.50/£41 $350/286 $99/£81
Page
Wordpress Theme MH Magazine Lite Free Free Free
Connect to Social IFTTT £24 £96 £24
Media
Spending in Year 1 will be £318 but this includes 4 year's website hosting.
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Later years
Total £318 £89 £89 £89 £259

Adrian Essex
07970705411

Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>

8 October 2023 at 16:58

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=2bb3a2fe09&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r-1269520875784775874&simpl=msg-a:r-4784079460...

To: Kalu Amogu <akamogu@hotmail.com>
Cc: Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com>

Hi Kalu,

Please see below email from Adrain.

In his role as the Vice Chair of Communication, he is currently working on the development of the WDCO website.
Adrian has put forth a proposal for several purchases related to the website. Could you please authorise the

below proposal? If approved, he intends to use his personal credit card, with the expectation of being reimbursed
for the expenses.
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Many thanks,

Roda Hassan
Independent Tenant and Leaseholder Adviser
Woodberry Down Estate

() 9
Public Voice

Mobile: 07715318125

Regeneration Drop in Advice Surgeries
Tuesdays and Thursdays 2-6pm

Woodberry Down Community Organisation
Unit 2c Rowan Apartments

Seven Sisters Road

London N4 1FS

From: Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, October 8, 2023 8:55 AM

To: Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>
Subject: WDCO website expenditure proposal

[Quoted text hidden]

A.K AMOGU <akamogu@hotmail.com> 11 October 2023 at 00:37
To: Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>, Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com>

Cc: Jackie Myers <jackiemyers68@gmail.com>, Philip Cooke <phil.cookewdco@outlook.com>, William Sheehy
<williamsheehy@outlook.com>, Andrea Anderson <andrea.anderson9@hotmail.com>, "k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk"
<k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk>, "leonora.williams@gmail.com" <leonora.williams@gmail.com>

Hi,

Thanks for your email on the above subject..

1. | cannot, on my own alone, approve any expenditure related to this item. | think that the detail has to be
shared with and approved by the entire Executive Committee.

2. Although | heard in passing that Hackney Council has approved our 23/24 budget, up till now the Council has
not made any payment to WDCO as representing part of that budget and | think it would be wise to have this
issue cleared before holding any meetings on how to spend money on a new item in our present budget. The
expenses we are running now are with left-over money from last year’s budget and they cover such essential
headings as VENUE HIRE.BOARD REFRESHMENTS.STATIONERY ITEMS, BANK CHARGES, ITEMS FOR
WDCO OFFICE and so on.

3. If I am alone in the foregoing thinking, | suggest we hold a short Executive meeting on the issue as soon as
possible.

THANKS

Kalu
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Sent from Mail for Windows

From: Roda Hassan

Sent: 08 October 2023 16:58

To: Kalu Amogu

Cc: Adrian Essex

Subject: Fw: WDCO website expenditure proposal
Importance: High

Hi Kalu,
Please see below email from Adrain.

In his role as the Vice Chair of Communication, he is currently working on the development of the WDCO website.
Adrian has put forth a proposal for several purchases related to the website. Could you please authorise the below
proposal? If approved, he intends to use his personal credit card, with the expectation of being reimbursed for the

expenses.

Many thanks,

Roda Hassan
Independent Tenant and Leaseholder Adviser

Woodberry Down Estate

0

Public Voice

Mobile: 07715318125

Regeneration Drop in Advice Surgeries
Tuesdays and Thursdays 2-6pm
Woodberry Down Community Organisation

Unit 2c Rowan Apartments

Seven Sisters Road
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[Quoted text hidden]

Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com> 11 October 2023 at O .

To: "A. KAMOGU" <akamogu@hotmail.com>

Cc: Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>, Jackie Myers <jackiemyers68@gmail.com>, Philip Cooke
<phil.cookewdco@outlook.com>, William Sheehy <williamsheehy@outlook.com>, Andrea Anderson
<andrea.anderson9@hotmail.com>, "k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk" <k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk>, "leonora.williams@gmail.com"
<leonora.williams@gmail.com>

Kalu
Thanks for getting back to me.

It is my understanding that | was appointed to the communications role in large part to revise the website, a

responsibility. | believe that with that responsibility should go the authority to make the changes | see fit. The task was

also allocated a budget at our annual budget setting meeting. later amended and approved by the full board.

You have been appointed Treasurer, a role which | would expect carries with it the authority to make financial
decisions. | am slightly surprised you feel the need to go back to the executive.

It is disappointing that we have not had our grant from Hackney, some 7 months into the financial year. Would it be
possible to streamline this process next year?

At the moment | am full of enthusiasm for the website project and want to crack on with it. Any delay at this stage
would be disappointing.

The actual sums involved are quite small. The current website is a poor thing, and yet it is the public face of WDCO.

Please do grant the approval | have asked for.

Thanks
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Adrian Essex
07970705411
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Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london> 17 October 2023 at 20:43

To: Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com>

Hi Adrian,
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Please bear with me; | haven't forgotten about this. | tried reaching out to Kalu yesterday and today but haven't
been able to speak to him. Once | have the opportunity to speak with him, | will update you.

Many thanks,
Roda Hassan

Independent Tenant and Leaseholder Adviser @
Woodberry Down Estate
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Public Voice

Mobile: 07715318125

Regeneration Drop in Advice Surgeries
Tuesdays and Thursdays 2-6pm

Woodberry Down Community Organisation
Unit 2c Rowan Apartments

Seven Sisters Road

London N4 1FS

From: Adrian Essex <omotng@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023 8:51 AM

To: A.K AMOGU <akamogu@hotmail.com>

Cc: Roda Hassan <roda.hassan@publicvoice.london>; Jackie Myers <jackiemyers68@gmail.com>; Philip Cooke
<phil.cookewdco@outlook.com>; William Sheehy <williamsheehy@outlook.com>; Andrea Anderson
<andrea.anderson9@hotmail.com>; k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk <k_zagar@yahoo.co.uk>;
leonora.williams@gmail.com <leonora.williams@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: WDCO website expenditure proposal

[Quoted text hidden]
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